- ORDINANCE 582 e

AN ORDINANCE of the Town oF MiLLs amending Chapter 15.10 of the Mills Municipal Code, and
adopting the 2012 edition of the International Fire Code, including certain appendices, and
amendments regulating and governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion
hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials and devices,
and from conditions hazardous to life or property within the TOWN OF MuLLs providing for the
issuance of permits and collection of fees therefore; repealing all other ordinances or parts of past
laws in conflict therewith.

WHEREAS the Town of Mills in accordance with Sections 15-1-701 through 15-1-801 of the
Wyoming Statutes, 1977 and the authority granted to the Town wishes to amend Chapter 15.10 of the
Mills Municipal Code, for the purpose of adopting the 2012 edition of the International Fire Code.

WHEREAS the Town of Mills is ever mindful of ensuring the security and safety from fire, and
promoting health and general welfare of the residents of Mills

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE TOWN OF
MILLS, WYOMING THE FOLLOWING:

Section 1:
Section 15.10.010 of the Mills Municipal Code is herby amended as follows:

oot o a o e laxz 4hig clhamtas nll afdho 10 {Tnafarms Civm Coda soith-all nmean diwag
J_JJ\\JVLJE— @ K AW A W W AW W R ) v i} o Fluswivy U')‘ (=4 5w UJ.LHIJLUL, [v 5 QLW L LA R ) AT IOTTIIT LN \-,/\J\.l\.d’ ¥y Lol Il MLJLJUILULAVO
mans] Babara aditionceicadonted-as the e da ey rarmine-condi b a8 T rrerdloraie o lifa nmd sspaie e

I TOvUL T TOTLY 1LY GUUHLU\J (% 7% % i LR Wo u LW 3 ey 5\) ¥ ULJJ.].‘LIE CTOTIOO TIVELS T OOy LU THIAY [(ZheLwY lJLUlJUL LJ P WIFEN
Lo s ovelocian sarathin the toasen ind $la oo ae adonted andain e mratard ac fallv aeaf ced oo
TG U VI\-HJ.UQLU.LL VY OO LI LyY J.j.: (o8 LW o L (89 0 B R R uuul.n.\-u [N LW N L, LW rE A v s . .l.bhll.)' (o 7o B S L AW LM A PR S A

Lo ot i thic ~hastor (Crved 2411027 Oy d 2272 £ mnety 1070 M A.. 272 81 {aana=ty  1O00N

TOITE U T LI VlLuPL\d.L- \\JL\J- -t !J., T 7O AT LU Slwul.l’}: T 77 PRAYS = Ty e ) 3l wulb}: p i j

That a certain document, two (2) copies of which is on file in the office of the TowN CLERK of the
TownN oF MILLS being marked and designated as the International Fire Code, 2012 edition, including
Appendix Chapters B, C, D, H, T AND J as published by the International Code Council, be and is
hereby adopted as the Fire Code of the TOWN OF MILLs in the State of WyoMiNG regulating and
governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the
storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials and devices, and from conditions
hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and premises as herein provided;
providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefore; and each and all of the
regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Fire Code on file in the office of the
Town OF MILLS are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this
ordinance, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in Section 2 and
Section 3 of this ordinance.



Section 2: .

Section 15.10.020 of the Mills Municipal Code is herby deleted and replaced with the following:

1< 1
0T

AN A smamlinnhility The Tlnifames Tiea Cada PRy
LIl T

) s ac oty mbioi and owiofieor
AV v rpw LHLJLAUHULLLLJ. T O TITIOTTOT TG SO ukll} g4 ~Tn) FTR AR EL G QWE R RSN LY UAJ.IJ‘-LLL&
4y

cterrotiiean Tl atizaxras L ore ateg ok asrrotin oy gty atieac hoarre anesanr e Matrpmalbar 7 1070 1
SHRCTH Co— IO w OV OO W Il I ATOL IS SRS THFe S e Ve Oy oo rr Ui v ot 7 F5IIT
culinth docomanlyr A0d 292 8lfaney 1070 Cyed 79 B amaaety TOTON
L U N L Wy U\JAJ.LPL)‘. \\JL\J- ey v’l\Pmb}’ 7 LT B W S | Sl\t}ul\-j’ 7 /}-

Mills Town Code Section 15.10.020 2012 International Fire Code revisions.

That the following sections of the 2012 International Fire Code are hereby revised:
Section 101.1. Insert: TOWN OF MILLS
Section 109.4. Insert: MISDEMEANOR, SEVEN HUNDRED AND FIFTY (750), 0 DAYS
Section 111.4. Insert: Frve HUNDRED (500) SEVEN HUNDRED AND FIFTY (750)
SecTION 109.3 1S DELETED AND REPLACED AS FOLLOWS!

SECTION 109.3 THE FIRE CHIEF OR THE FIRE CHIEF'S DESIGNEE SHALL HAVE AUTHORITY TO ISSUE A
WRITTEN CITATION CONTAINING A NOTICE TO APPEAR IN MUNICIPAL COURT TO ANY PERSON, WHO
SAID FIRE CHIEF OR THE FIRE CODE OFFICAL HAVE PROBABLE CAUSE TO BELIEVE IS COMMITTING A
VIOLATION OR HAS COMMITTED A VIOLATION OF ANY OF THE TERMS WITH IN OF THIS CODE.

SecTioN 105.1.1 18 AMENDED TO INCLUDE!

SECTION 105.1.1 A PERMIT SHALL BE OBTAINED FROM THE FIRE CODE OFFICAL PRIOR TO
ENGAGING IN ANY ACTIVITY OUTLINED IN SECTION 105 OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE. ANY

FEES ASSOCIATED WITH THE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS SHALL BE ESTABLISHED BY RESOLUTION OF THE
TOWN COUNCIL.

SECTION 505.1 1S DELETED AND REPLACED AS FOLLOWS!
SECTION 505.1. PREMISES IDENTIFICATION.

APPROVED NUMBERS OR ADDRESSES SHALL BE PLACED ON ALL NEW AND EXISTING BUILDINGS IN
SUCH A POSITION AS TO BE PLAINLY VISIBLE AND LEGIBLE FROM THE STREET OR ROAD FRONTING THE
PROPERTY. SAID NUMBERS SHALL CONTRAST WITH THEIR BACKGROUND, SHALL BE ARABIC
NUMERALS AND SHALL HAVE A MINIMUM HEIGHT DIMENSION OF AT LEAST FOUR INCHES (4") WITH A
MINIMUM STROKE WIDTH OF (0.5). ADDRESS ILLUMINATION SHALL BE INSTALLED ON ALL NEW
CONSTRUCTION, ILLUMINATION SHALL BE FROM DUSK TILL DAWN, AND ILLUMINATED FROM THE
REAR OR DIRECT IN A FASHION NOT TO BE DISABLED OTHER THAN FOR SERVICE.

SECTION 506.1 1S DELETED AND REPLACED AS FOLLOWS!

SECTION 506.1. WHEN ACCESS TO OR WITHIN A STRUCTURE OR AN AREA IS UNDULY DIFFICULT
BECAUSE OF SECURED OPENINGS OR WHERE IMMEDIATE ACCESS IS NECESSARY FOR LIFE-SAVING OR
FIRE FIGHTING PURPOSES, THE FIRE CHIEF MAY REQUIRE A KEY BOX TO BE INSTALLED. KEY BOX
CONTENTS MUST INCLUDE A FULL SET OF OPERABLE KEYS TO THE OCCUPANCY OR OCCUPANCIES, THE
KEYS SHALL BE IDENTIFIED AS TO USE, AND ANY DIAGRAMS AS REQUESTED BY THE FIRE CHIEF OR
DESIGNEE. IT SHALL BE THE OCCUPANT OR PROPERTY OWNER'S RESPONSIBILITY TO NOTIFY THE FIRE
CHIEF OR DESIGNEE IMMEDIATELY OF ANY KEY CHANGES TO THE BUILDING, BUILDINGS AND OR
PREMISES. KEY BOX MUST BE OF AN APPROPRIATE SIZE TO ACCOMMODATE ALL REQUIRED CONTENTS
WITHIN. BUILDING / PROPERTY OWNER/S OR OCCUPANT SHALL PURCHASE A KEY BOX DIRECTLY
FROM A VENDOR APPROVED BY THE FIRE CHIEF, THE LOCATION OF THE KEY BoX SHALL BE
PERMANENTLY AFFIXED NOT MORE THAN 6 FEET ABOVE FINISHED GRADE, BUT NOT LESS THAN 4
FEET ABOVE FINISHED GRADE. THE LOCATION IS TO BE SPECIFIED BY THE FIRE CHIEF OR DESIGNEE. A
KEY BOX SHALL BE REQUIRED FOR ANY BUILDING OR PREMISES WITHIN THE JURISDICTION THAT MEET
ANY ONE OF THE FOLLOWING:

2 TFIRE ALARM SYSTEM LOCAL OR REMOTE MONITORING (EXCLUDING R-3)

5. FIRE SUPPRESSION SYSTEM {EXCLUDING R-3 OCCUPANCIES)
c. MULT] UNIT COMMERCIAL / INDUSTRIAL BUILDINGS OCCUPANCIES



ASSEMBLY GROUP A OCCUPANCIES

BUSINESS GROUP B OCCUPANCIES
EDUCATIONAL GROUP E OCCUPANCIES
FACTORY INDUSTRIAL GROUP F OCCUPANCIES

m oo M ow

HIGH-HAZARD GROUP I OCCUPANCIES

—

INSTITUTIONAL GROUP 1 OCCUPANCIES

5. MERCANTILE GROUP M OCCUPANCIES

k. RESIDENTIAL GROUP R OCCUPANCIES (EXCLUDING R-3 OCCUPANCIES}
L. STORAGE GROUP S OCCUPANCIES

SECTION 507.2 1S AMENDED TO READ AS FOLLOWS!
SrcTioN 507.2 TYPE OF WATER SUPPLY.

WATER SUPPLY MAY CONSIST OF RESERVOIRS, PRESSURE TANKS, ELEVATED TANKS, WATER MAINS,
OR OTHER FIXED SYSTEMS CAPABLE OF PROVIDING THE REQUIRED FIRE FLOW. IN SETTING THE
REQUIREMENTS FOR FIRE FLOW, THE FIRE CHIEF SHALL BE GUIDED BY THE PROVISION IN APPENDIX B
OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, 2003 EDITION.

SecTIoN 5601.1.3 1S AMENDED AS FOLLOWS!

SECTION 5601.1.3. POSSESSION, STORAGE, USE, HANDLING, AND SALES OF ALL FIREWORKS IS
PROHIBITED.

ExcepTION: 1) THE USE OF FIREWORKS FOR DISPLAY IS ALLOWED AS SET FORTH IN SECTION 5608

SECTION 5704.1 IS AMENDED AS FOLLOWS!
QEeTION 5704, 1 GENERAL.

1. THE STORAGE OF FLAMMABLE AND COMBUSTIBLE LIQUIDS IN CLOSED CONTAINERS, OR PORTABLE
TANKS OUTSIDE OF BUILDINGS, SHALL BE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THIS CODE. POSSESSION OF A VALID
PERMIT ISSUED PURSUANT TO SECTION 105 SHALL BE A PRECONDITION TO STORAGE. NoN-
PERMITTED STORAGE IS HEREBY DECLARED ILLEGAL.

2. QUTSIDE PORTABLE CONTAINER STORAGE OF PERMITTED FLAMMABLE AND COMBUSTIBLE LIQUIDS
SHALL ONLY BE ALLOWED IN THE INDUSTRIAL ZONES OF THE JURISDICTION.

3, PORTABLE TANK STORAGE 1S PRORIBITED.
EXCEPTIONS: 1) PORTABLE TANKS WHICH ARE LOCATED WITHIN A SPECIAL ENCLOSURE AS

DESCRIBED IN SECTION 2306.2.6, OR EQUIVALENT ARE PERMITTED.

2) TEMPORARY STORAGE OF FLAMMARBLE AND COMBUSTIBLE LIQUIDS USED

AT CONSTRUCTION SITES.

3) PERMITS FOR PORTABLE TANKS ARE TO BE ISSUED ONLY AFTER INSPECTION
AND APPROVAL BY THE FIRE CODE OFFICAL AND PURSUANT TO

SECTION 105.



Section 3:
Section 15.10.030 of the Mills Municipal Code is herby deleted and replaced with the following:

15310 020 Coansefiline Ta a aaydla st Foe_adeeton obihiccadebyvthetovwiis dorivad. B
T RO U \_/Ut}j .Ll.ll].].&- LTINS RJ-UI:LLULJ.LJ’ PRwY uu.uj:luuzx Lo i s LW L B j THTOTO P I Ly Wil eil TTOTIT
Cantice 15 .1 120 Woamine-Statytes Aaedntad 1077 _and o aiffcientnamberofcopies Iapt-aat
SreS e TV Ly U Aot b s D LS (oA vl S ey we s g APRN =0 B Av S IR AN S R A A2 RO O T o oopITT oy UHTInoT
lace tlham fuza.onmiac aftha ~anda ahall s ot o £iladn tha affoa af 4o tongre ol arle foe

1S5 HHET- T O-COP e Ui ouidhy o i et LEA~ar iR~ TAM AR T A TS O EHEC Ot O v v sUL
et s s nad 1en, aftha wublic aad chall boa svmavlead st dhe vrnrda "Tavgn

lli\JlJ\-/\-dL.l\Jl]. U)’ [50 i L' A W L W W W MY R HUULL‘-’ (= LU ¥ ¥ {2 T PP L T oo vy TeXLLIw VY U,L'-JJ, T Ooryvid

b Mille SA uzamnim o ) S il Ty M ((ed DR &1 1070 Oyed DI 87 10700

TITIVETTL, ¥y JULLILAL&, Qg gy AN \/ULJJ’- \Ul.u- . e s&, 77 K] AW AW ey b’ 5 L T j

Mills Code Section 15.10.030 Geographic limits

That the geographic limits referred to in certain sections of the 2012 International Fire Code are
hereby established as follows:

Section 5704.2.9.6.1 The limits referred to in Section 5704.2.9.6.1 of the International Fire
Code in which storage of flammable or combustible liquids in outside aboveground tanks is
prohibited, shall apply in all areas within the jurisdiction except for allowed in the established
or developing industrial zone (ELDI) .

EXCEPTION: Outside aboveground tanks which are located within a special enclosure, as
described in Section 2306.2.6, or equivalent are permitted.

Section 5806.2 (geographic limits in which the storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in
stationary containers is prohibited): ESTABLISHED RESIDENTIAL, DEVELOPING RESIDENTIAL,
ESTABLISHED BUSINESS, DEVELOPING BUSINESS, AND ESTABLISHED INDUSTRIAL

Section 6104.2 (geographic limits in which the storage of liquefied petroleum gas is restricted
for the protection of heavily populated or congested areas): ESTABLISHED RESIDENTIAL,
DEVELOPING RESIDENTIAL, AND DEVELOPING BUSINESS

Section 4. THE 2006/2003 EDITIONS OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, INCLUDING ANY VERSION
OF THE UNIFORM FIRE CODE, the following Town of Mills ordinances (341), (283),( 278 ), and the
following Town of Mills Municipal Codes 15.10.040 ( Board of Appeals) 15.10.050 (Violation
each day a separate offense) are hereby repealed and deleted entirely.

Section 5. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance is, for any
reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining
portions of this ordinance. The TowN COUNCIL hereby declares that it would have passed this
Jaw, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or
more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional.

Section 6. That nothing in this ordinance or in the Fire Code hereby adopted shall be construed
to affect the right or ability of the Town of Mills to initiate any suit or proceeding impending in
any court, or any rights acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause ot causes of action acquired
or existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 4 of this law; nor shail
any just or legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this ordinance.



>
PASSED ON FIRST READING the (3 _ dayof /Mg, 2012

PASSED ON SECOND READING the Po* __day of /7iL ,2012
PASSED, APPROVED, AND ADOPTED ON THIRD AND
FINAL READING the _ /) dayof Sz 2012

TOWN OF MILLS, WYOMING

. ;ﬂ' 2 '; /
(W A PPN 77,7 ;o g ;
) By: / ? vl Uﬁé/ 4 /{, . "//"Z’ i
/ Elsie I. Herlort, Mayor

rrese A i fedy e

Sue Regennas
Town Clerk

I, Sue Regennas, Town Clerk of the Town of Mills, Wyoming, do hereby certify that the
foregoing is a true and correct copy of Ordinance No. 582, entitled "AN ORDINANCE of the TOwN
oF MiLLs amending Chapter 15.10 of the Mills Municipal Code, and adopting the 2012 edition
of the International Fire Code, including certain appendices, and amendments regulating and
governing the safeguarding of life and property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the
storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials and devices, and from conditions
hazardous to life or property within the TowN oF MILLs providing for the issuance of permits
and collection of fees therefore; repealing all other ordinances or parts of past laws in conflict
therewith." :

passed on First Reading by the Town Council-ef the Town of Mills, Wyoming, at a regular meeting held by the
Council Members on the ___{ a*day of 3,201

Sue Regennas, Town Clerk \\\\\\u itify
RATE

N
N a0

]
.0

-,

I, the regularly appointed, duly qualified and action as Town Clerk of the Town @ ; ;g'"--.....--‘".

Wyoming do hereby certify that signed, attested, sealed, and certified copies of this/'@’); ;

No. 582 approved and passed as certified above, and following its passage by the Towﬂ’@b‘dﬁéﬂ}\
was posted in the Town Clerk's Office and at the Mills Post Office for a period of ten (10) days

as required by law; that it 501{ effect a jbecame in force as a legal ordinance of the Town of
§¢2# ,

Mills, Wyoming on the day of \72?2

Sue Regennas, Town Clerk

f///

oy
‘g3
w

7,
NG

W

NG
iy

y //’!

7,
4'/

\

“
“



